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When Tom Galley, a successful career thief, befriends the lovely computer savvy Kate Kincaid, he feels he
has found the perfect accomplice for a heist he has planned. Kate's technical expertise as a securities analyst
does not exempt her from his charm and a smile that could sell things. She agrees to a summer sail with Tom
and his best friend Nathan Gage. They are joined by the witty, upbeat Gretchen Tillane who is only too
willing to escape a vindictive ex-husband. Beyond The Mast is one part romance adventure, one part
sophisticated heist and one part murder. On a cruise to the stark, exotic beauty of the Sea of Cortez the two
couples develop a closeness and familiarity that can only be found in sailing. Along the way they encounter a
host of unexpected characters from adventurers and knock abouts to bandits and expatriates. The action turns
sinister when the group is forced to execute two young Indian pirates, an act which follows them back to
California. Only upon the return voyage do they learn graphically, the value of a single life. The book
concludes with a murder investigation in San Diego and an intriguing cat and mouse game in the financial
centers of Atlanta. Ultimately, the characters must determine at which point loyalty compromises one's sense
of integrity and when does trust override personal ambition.
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From reader reviews:

Anna Sanders:

The particular book Beyond the Mast will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading the book.
The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book you just read, this
book very acceptable to you. The book Beyond the Mast is much recommended to you to study. You can
also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.

Stephen Galvan:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with close friends is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster
you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Beyond the Mast, it is possible to enjoy both.
It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen
its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Gregory Medina:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray a person, why because this Beyond the Mast book written by well-
known writer we are excited for well how to make book that could be understand by anyone who all read the
book. Written within good manner for you, dripping every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your
personal hunger then you still doubt Beyond the Mast as good book but not only by the cover but also
through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't assess book by its handle, so do you still needing
a different sixth sense to pick this specific!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already told you so why
you have to listening to a different sixth sense.

Edward Grimes:

A lot of people said that they feel bored when they reading a publication. They are directly felt that when
they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Beyond the Mast to make your own reading
is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose
very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the opinion about book and reading through
especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to available a book and read it. Beside that the reserve
Beyond the Mast can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse with what must
you're doing of their time.
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