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Directing Disney

Part diary, part correspondence, part historical essay, this unique book presents the life of Walt Disney's
most acclaimed director, Wilfred Jackson, whose long career began with the earliest Mickey Mouse shorts
and continued through Snow White, Lady and the Tramp, and many more.

Wilfred Jackson was universally recognized by his colleagues and by animation historians as the best and
most thorough of Disney directors.

He is the man behind Academy-Award winners The Tortoise and the Hare, The Country Cousin, and The
Old Mill and the director of some of the most famous sequences from Disney’s animated features.

For seven years, “Jaxon” corresponded with Disney historian Ross Care. In his letters to Care, he discussed
in tremendous details his career, his thought process, and his work on the Disney shorts and features. These
fascinating letters are a treasure trove for Disney history enthusiasts.

In addition, while preparing this volume, Ross and editor Didier Ghez discovered Jaxon’s unpublished diary
as well as a series of captivating letters that the director sent to his family in 1945 during the filming of Song
of the South.

All these priceless documents as well as Ross Care’s in-depth essay about Jaxon’s career are presented in
this book for the very first time.
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From reader reviews:

Victoria Manson:

This Disney Legend Wilfred Jackson: A Life in Animation book is just not ordinary book, you have it then
the world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is usually information inside this
publication incredible fresh, you will get details which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information
you will get. This specific Disney Legend Wilfred Jackson: A Life in Animation without we comprehend
teach the one who reading it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't always be worry Disney
Legend Wilfred Jackson: A Life in Animation can bring if you are and not make your tote space or
bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it inside your lovely laptop even cell phone. This
Disney Legend Wilfred Jackson: A Life in Animation having excellent arrangement in word as well as
layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Bessie Kraft:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by talk with the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each details they get. How individuals to be
smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Examining a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Disney Legend Wilfred Jackson: A
Life in Animation book since this book offers you rich facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Angela Bauer:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-
book method, more simple and reachable. This specific Disney Legend Wilfred Jackson: A Life in
Animation can give you a lot of buddies because by you looking at this one book you have thing that they
don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get
success. This publication offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than other make you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? We should have Disney Legend Wilfred
Jackson: A Life in Animation.

Amy Gutierrez:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This reserve Disney Legend Wilfred Jackson: A Life in Animation was filled in relation to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has distinct
feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can sense enjoy to
read a publication. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book you wanted.
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