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            When still a young dancer in the New York City Ballet, Suki Schorer was chosen by George
Balanchine to lecture, demonstrate, and teach—he recognized in her that rare dancer who not only performs
superbly but can also successfully pass along what she knows to others. In Suki Schorer on Balanchine
Technique, she commits to paper the fruit of her twenty-four-year collaboration with Balanchine in a close
examination of his technique for teachers, scholars, and advanced students of the ballet.
            Schorer discusses the crucial work at the barre as well as center work, port de bras, pointework,
jumps, partnering, and more. Her recollections of her own tutelage under Balanchine and her brilliant use of
scores of his remarks about dancing and dancers lend both authority and intimacy to this extraordinary
analysis of Balanchine’s legacy to the future of dance.
            Abundantly illustrated throughout with instructional photographs featuring members of the New
York City Ballet, this book will serve as an indispensable testament to Balanchine’s ideas on technique and
performance.
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From reader reviews:

Norman Williams:

The book Suki Schorer on Balanchine Technique can give more knowledge and information about
everything you want. Why must we leave the great thing like a book Suki Schorer on Balanchine Technique?
A few of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim which book can give many information for
us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or info that you take for that,
you could give for each other; you can share all of these. Book Suki Schorer on Balanchine Technique has
simple shape but you know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world by
open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

James Miguel:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try factor that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Suki Schorer on Balanchine
Technique, you are able to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its called reading
friends.

Coralee Lowe:

This Suki Schorer on Balanchine Technique is great book for you because the content that is full of
information for you who have always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This
particular book reveal it info accurately using great coordinate word or we can state no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only
offers you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with lovely delivering sentences.
Having Suki Schorer on Balanchine Technique in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it
is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no reserve that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but
this publication already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still
doubt this?

Rodolfo Odum:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or outlined from each source that will filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and
comic. You can add your understanding by that book. Ready to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just trying to find the Suki Schorer on Balanchine Technique when you required it?
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