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Dates are an important fruit, especially in many African, Middle-Eastern and Asian countries. In recent years
this fruit has gained significant importance in terms of global commerce. During the period 1990–2009,
global production of dates saw an increase of 219% and this trend is expected to continue as per FAO
projections. Some of the major challenges confronting date fruit production and commerce are issues related
to postharvest handling technologies, use of appropriate processing and packaging technologies, food safety
aspects and quality assurance.

Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing Technology and Health Benefits provides contemporary information
that brings together current knowledge and practices in the value chain of dates, from production through to
consumption. The important book published by Wiley Blackwell features coverage from leading experts on
innovative processing technologies, packaging, quality management and pest control for dates. It is the only
book to address the science and technology of the postharvest production of dates, a commercially important
and growing sector of the food industry.
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From reader reviews:

Nelson Wyatt:

The book Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing Technology and Health Benefits gives you the sense of
being enjoy for your spare time. You may use to make your capable more increase. Book can being your best
friend when you getting tension or having big problem along with your subject. If you can make reading a
book Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing Technology and Health Benefits being your habit, you can get
more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all subjects. You
may know everything if you like open up and read a publication Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing
Technology and Health Benefits. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science book or encyclopedia or
other people. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Lewis Wade:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold
on guys this specific aren't like that. This Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing Technology and Health
Benefits book is readable by means of you who hate those straight word style. You will find the info here are
arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want
to give to you. The writer associated with Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing Technology and Health
Benefits content conveys thinking easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not
different in the information but it just different as it. So , do you still thinking Dates: Postharvest Science,
Processing Technology and Health Benefits is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Michelle Shaw:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Make an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't determine book by its protect may
doesn't work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that
fantastic as in the outside look likes. Maybe you answer can be Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing
Technology and Health Benefits why because the fantastic cover that make you consider about the content
will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is usually fantastic as the outside or cover. Your reading
sixth sense will directly show you to pick up this book.

Jan Dixon:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is written or printed or outlined from each source which filled update of news. Within this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From media social
like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking
the Dates: Postharvest Science, Processing Technology and Health Benefits when you desired it?
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